ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF HERCULES
REPEALING AND REPLACING HERCULES MUNICIPAL CODE TITLE 9 “BUILDING
REGULATIONS”, CHAPTERS 1-18, AND RELOCATING THE BOARD OF APPEALS
CHAPTER, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE CONTRA COSTA COUNTY ORDINANCE
NO. 2025-19, NO. 2025-15 AND NO. 2025-14 WHICH ADOPTS THE 2025 CALIFORNIA
CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 24, MAKING CERTAIN CHANGES, ADDITIONS,
AND DELETIONS, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE UNIFORM CODE FOR
ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS 1997 EDITION WITH EXISTING
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, AND DELETIONS, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 2024 EDITION WITH
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, AND DELETIONS, AND FINDING THE ORDINANCE
EXEMPT FROM THE CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT.

WHEREAS, every three years the State of California adopts new construction codes; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to repeal and replace existing chapters of Title 9 in order
to reorganize, clarify, and modernize the City’s building and safety regulations and to ensure
consistency with the California Building Standards Code and County-adopted amendments; and

WHEREAS, on November 4, 2025, the County Board of Supervisors adopted County Ordinance
No. 2025-19 adopting 2025 California Building Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24,
Part 2 Volumes 1 and 2), Residential Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2.5),
Electrical Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 3), Mechanical Code (California
Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 4), Plumbing Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24,
Part 5), Energy Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 6), Historical Building Code
California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 8), Existing Building Code California Code of
Regulations, Title 24, Part 10), and Green Building Standards Code (California Code of
Regulations, Title 24, Part 11), with amendments pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections
17922, 17958, 17958.5, and 17958.7, and Government Code sections 50020 through 50022.10
(collectively, the “County Building Code”); and

WHEREAS, on November 18, 2025, the County Board of Supervisors acting in its capacity as
the Board of Directors of the Crockett-Carquinez Fire Protection District and the Contra Costa
County Fire Protection District adopted County Ordinance No. 2025-14 adopting 2025 California
Fire Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9), with amendments pursuant to
Health and Safety Code sections 17922, 17958, 17958.5, and 17958.7, and Government Code
sections 50020 through 50022.10 (collectively, the “County Fire Code”); and

Ordinance No. ___
Page 1 of 88



WHEREAS, on December 9, 2025 the County Board of Supervisors acting in its capacity as the
Board of Directors of the Crockett-Carquinez Fire Protection District and the Contra Costa
County Fire Protection District adopted County Ordinance No. 2025-15 adopting 2025 California
Wildland-Urban Interface Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 7) with
amendments pursuant to Health and Safety Code sections 17922, 17958, 17958.5, and 17958.7,
and Government Code sections 50020 through 50022.10 (collectively, the “County Wildland
Code”); and

WHEREAS, the City of Hercules desires to adopt the new California Building Standards Code
with amendments developed and adopted by the County of Contra Costa through Ordinance No.
2025-19 and by the County Board of Supervisors acting in its capacity as the Board of Directors
of the Crockett-Carquinez Fire Protection District and the Contra Costa County Fire Protection
District through Ordinance Nos. 2025-14 and 2025-15 (collectively, the “County Building
Codes”); and

WHEREAS, the County’s ordinances (“County Ordinances”) contained findings supporting
County and Fire District amendments, additions, and deletions to the California Building
Standards Code that are now codified in the County Building Codes, and such findings are
included in the County Ordinances; and

WHEREAS, the City’s proposed ordinance (“Ordinance”) establishes a new General Provisions
chapter applicable to Title 9, which includes administrative provisions, references to the Building
Official, and consolidated enforcement and penalty provisions previously located elsewhere in
the Municipal Code; and

WHEREAS, the proposed Ordinance relocates the Board of Appeals provisions to Chapter 2 of
Title 9 without substantive modification, preserving existing appeal rights and procedures; and

WHEREAS, the proposed Ordinance relocates the Uniform Code for the Abatement of
Dangerous Buildings to Chapter 4 of Title 9 and readopts the 1994 edition of that code with the
City’s existing amendments, additions, and deletions; and

WHEREAS, the proposed Ordinance relocates the International Property Maintenance Code to
Chapter 5 of Title 9 and updates the adopted reference to the 2024 edition, with the City’s
existing amendments, additions, and deletions; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the reorganization, relocation, updating, and deletion of
provisions within Title 9 are administrative and structural in nature, do not impose new or more
restrictive building standards, and are necessary to promote clarity, consistency, and effective
enforcement of building and safety regulations within the City; and

Ordinance No. ___
Page 2 of 88



WHEREAS, the City Council desires to adopt this Ordinance to ensure that the Hercules
Municipal Code remains current, internally consistent, and aligned with State and County
building standards.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF HERCULES DOES
HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. CEQA REVIEW. Pursuant to the California Environmental Quality Act (Pub.
Res. Code sections 21000 et seq.; “CEQA?”), this Ordinance is not a “project” for purposes of
CEQA review pursuant to CEQA Guidelines section 15378 because it is an administrative
activity that does not authorize any construction and will not have any impact on the
environment. Further, even if adoption of the Ordinance was considered a project, it is exempt
CEQA review because it can be seen with certainty that adoption of these building codes and
local amendments intended to protect the environment will not have a significant impact on the
environment.

SECTION 2. FINDINGS. The City Council hereby makes all findings required to adopt the
County Codes, including all findings related to climatic, geological, or topographical conditions
that are required to make local amendments to the California Building Standards Code, which
findings are contained in the County Ordinances attached to the staff report for this Ordinance
and are hereby incorporated by reference.

SECTION 3. REPEAL AND REPLACE. City of Hercules Municipal Code Title 9 “Buildings
Regulations” is deleted and replaced with the following (deleted text is shown in strikeout):

Title 9 Building Regulations
Chapter 1 GENERAL PROVISIONS

Sec. 9-1.01 Administration.
The ordinance codified in this title is adopted as the building regulations of the
City of Hercules and may be cited as such.

Sec. 9-1.02 Reference to officials in adopted codes.

Whenever reference is made in this Title or the codes adopted by reference in
this title, to the "building inspector”, "inspector”, "electrical inspector”, "plumbing
inspector”, "mechanical inspector”, "building official, "Director of the Building
Inspection Department”, "City building inspector” or "City building official”, it shall
mean the Contra Costa County director of building inspection, county building
official, building inspector, or any of his or her duly authorized deputies during
such period when the County of Contra Costa is providing building inspection
services for the City of Hercules and while such officials are acting as the City's
representatives in such matters. These terms shall also include the City

Ordinance No. ___
Page 3 of 88



Manager, Community Development Director or City Engineer and their
designees when enforcing the provisions of this title. Furthermore, references to
"state” shall mean the State of California, to "Housing Act" shall mean the
Housing Act of this state, to "county building official, administrative authority, or
fire chief" shall mean the director of building inspection of Contra Costa County,
and to "county" shall mean the County of Contra Costa.

Sec. 9-1.04 Violation-Penalty

Any violation of the code sections designated in this Title shall constitute an
infraction, unless provided otherwise. The City of Hercules may prosecute
violations of this Title as misdemeanors in addition to any other remedies
provided in this Code or allowed by law.

Section 1-4.01 outlines the penalties for any failure to comply with any of the
requirements of the Municipal Code for either misdemeanors or infractions.

Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any
work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system
before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to double fee penalty for
all required permits as allowed by the California Building Codes.

Failure to comply. Any person who continues any work after having been served
with a stop work order is subject to an administrative citation per the procedure
outlined in Section 1-4.02, Administrative Citations—Procedures, except any
work that a person is directed by the building official to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 4 of 88



Chapter 2 BOARD OF APPEALS
Sec. 9-2.01 Administration.

The Board of Appeals shall consist of three (3) members, who shall be qualified
by experience in training to pass upon matters pertaining to building construction
and who are not employees of this jurisdiction.

Sec. 9-2.02 Appointments.
The members of the Board shall be appointed by the City Council.
Sec. 9-2.03 Term.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 5 of 88



The members of the Board shall serve for a term of two (2) years, or until their
successors are appointed, unless removed from office as specified in Section 9-
9.05.

Sec. 9-2.04 Powers and Duties.

(a) To affirm, reverse, modify, or set aside any finding, determination, notice, or
action of the Building Official which is appealed relating to the provisions of the
Uniform Codes adopted as amended by the City of Hercules; and to determine
on appeal from the decision of the Building Official the suitability of alternate
materials and methods or type of construction, and to provide for reasonable
interpretations of the Uniform Codes adopted by the City of Hercules.

(b) To establish rules of procedure for notices and service, conducting of
investigations and hearings on appeal, and rendering of decisions.

(c) To serve in an advisory capacity to refer any owner and/or occupant to an
appropriate public or private agency for information. Upon hearing appeals, the
Board shall exercise its powers in such manner that the public welfare is secured
and substantial justice is done most nearly in accord with the intent and purpose
of this Chapter.

Sec. 9-2.05 Removal.

Members of the Board of Appeals serve at the pleasure of the City Council, and
may be removed at any time, with or without cause, by a majority vote of the
Council.

Sec. 9-2.06 Quorum.

For the purpose of transacting business, a quorum of the Board shall consist of
two (2) members.

Sec. 9-2.07 Officers.

At the first meeting of each calendar year the Board shall elect its officers. The
Building Official shall be the secretary of the Board.

Sec. 9-2.08 Administering Oaths—Subpoenas.

Each member of the Board shall have the power to administer oaths. The City
Clerk shall issue subpoenas; willful failure to appear to testify in response to any
such subpoena or to produce any item pursuant to a subpoena duces tecum
shall be punished as a misdemeanor; the City Clerk shall cause subpoenas to be
issued under the seal of the City.

Sec. 9-2.09 Appeals.

Any person may appeal and shall be apprised of his right to appeal to the Board
on subjects coming within the Board's jurisdiction, provided the appeal is made in
writing and filed at the office of the Board, and upon the payment of the filing fee

Ordinance No. ___
Page 6 of 88



as set from time to time by resolution of the City Council, within ten (10) days
after notice of any protested decision or action made pursuant to this Title.

Sec. 9-2.10 Hearings.

All hearings and meetings of the Board shall be open to the public. Records and
minutes shall be kept of all proceedings of the Board and copies of the minutes
shall be a matter of public record. The Board shall render all decisions and
findings in writing to the Building Official with a duplicate copy to the appellant,
and shall apprise said interested parties of their right to appeal to the City
Council and the time limitations for such appeal.

Sec. 9-2.11 Action by Council.

(a) An aggrieved person or persons and/or the Building Official may appeal the
decision of the Board by filing a notice of appeal with the City Clerk within ten
(10) days of the decision. The Board shall apprise said persons of their right to
appeal to the Council and of the time limitations to appeal. Immediately upon
receipt of timely notice of appeal, the City Clerk shall set the time and place for
consideration of the appeal by the Council, and shall thereupon give written
notice to all persons whose interest therein has been recorded in any of the
proceedings theretofore. Failure to file a timely notice of appeal shall relieve the
City Clerk of the duty to set the matter for consideration by the Council.

(b) The Council shall review the proceedings and decision of the Board when the
decision of the Board is appealed to it. The Council may affirm, reverse, or
modify, by resolution, the Board's decision and its decision shall be final.

Sec. 9-2.12 Enforcement.

The Building Official of the City is authorized and directed to administer and
enforce the provisions of this Chapter.

Sec. 9-2.13 Right of Entry.

Whenever necessary to make an inspection to enforce any of the provisions of
this Code, or whenever the Building Official or his authorized representative has
reasonable cause to believe that there exists in any building or upon any
premises any condition which makes such building or premises unsafe as
defined in relevant Uniform Codes, the Building Official or his authorized
representative, at all reasonable times, may enter said premises to inspect the
same or to perform any duty imposed upon the Building Official by this Code;
provided, that if such building or premises be occupied, he shall first make a
reasonable effort to locate the owner or other persons having charge or control
of the building or premises and demand entry. If such entry is refused, the
Building Official or his authorized representative shall have recourse to every
remedy provided by law to secure entry.

Sec. 9-2.14 Rules and Regulations.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 7 of 88



The Council may, from time to time, adopt by resolution rules and regulations to
execute the provisions of this Chapter. This may not affect the substance of the

Chapter, but shall be limited to methods and procedures in the enforcement and
administration of the Chapter.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 8 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/24
https://ecode360.com/47765251#47765251
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765253
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/50020
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/50022.9
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765254
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765255
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765256
https://ecode360.com/47765258#47765258

Ordinance No. ___
Page 9 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765257
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765258
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765259
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765260

Ordinance No. ___
Page 10 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765261
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765262
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765263
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765264
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765265
https://ecode360.com/47767458#47767458
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765266
https://ecode360.com/47767458#47767458

Ordinance No. ___
Page 11 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765267
https://ecode360.com/47767458#47767458
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765268
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765269
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765270
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765271
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765272

Ordinance No. ___
Page 12 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765273
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765274
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765275
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/17959.6
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765276
https://municipal.codes/CA/HSC/
https://municipal.codes/CA/HSC/
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765277
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765278
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765279
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765280

Ordinance No. ___
Page 13 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765281
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765282
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765283
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/24
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765284
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765285
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765286
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765287
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765288
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765289
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765290
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765291
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765292

Ordinance No. ___
Page 14 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765293
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765294
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765295
https://ecode360.com/47765296#47765296
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765296
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765297
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765298
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765299
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765300
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765301
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765302

Ordinance No. ___
Page 15 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765303
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765304
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765305
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765306
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765307
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765308
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765309
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765310
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765311
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765312
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765313
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765314
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765315
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765316
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765317
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765318
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765319
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765320

Ordinance No. ___
Page 16 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765306#47765306
https://ecode360.com/47765385#47765385
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765321
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765322
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765323
https://ecode360.com/47765385#47765385
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765324
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765325
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765326
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765327
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765328
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765329
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765330
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765331
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765332
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765333
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765334
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765335
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765336
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765337
https://ecode360.com/47765323#47765323
https://ecode360.com/47765383#47765383

Ordinance No. ___
Page 17 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765381#47765381
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765338
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765339
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765340
https://ecode360.com/47765381#47765381
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765341
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765342
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765343
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765344
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765345
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765346
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765347
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765348
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765349
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765350
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765351
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765352
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765353

Ordinance No. ___
Page 18 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765354
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765355
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765356
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765357
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765358
https://ecode360.com/47765385#47765385
https://ecode360.com/47765385#47765385
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765359
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765360
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765361
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765362
https://ecode360.com/47765385#47765385
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765363
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765364
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765365

Ordinance No. ___
Page 19 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765366
https://ecode360.com/47765385#47765385
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765367
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765368
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765369
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765370
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765371
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765372
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765373
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765374
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765375
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765376
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765377
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765378

Ordinance No. ___
Page 20 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765379
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765380
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765381
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765382
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765383
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765384
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765385
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765386
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765387
https://ecode360.com/47759327#47759327
https://municipal.codes/CA/HSC/17910
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765388
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765389
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765390

Chapter 3 BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
Sec. 9-3.01 Adoption by Reference.

The 2025 California Building Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part
1 through 12), published by the International Code Council (ICC), is adopted by
the California Building Standards Commission into the California Building
Standards Code, Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations.

The provisions of County Ordinance No. 2025-19, approved by the Contra Costa
Board of Supervisors on November 4, 2025, adopting the 2025 California
Building Code (Part 2 Volume 1 & 2), the 2025 California Residential Code (Part
2.5), the 2025 California Electrical Code (Part 3), the 2025 California Mechanical
Code (Part 4), the 2025 California Plumbing Code (Part 5), the 2025 California
Energy Code (Part 6), the 2025 California Historical Building Code (Part 8), the
2025 California Existing Building Code (Part 10) and the 2025 California Green
Building Standards Code (Part 11) with changes, additions and deletions, are
adopted by reference under the authority of Sections 50020-50022.9 of the
California Government Code.

The provisions of County Ordinance No. 2025-14, approved by the Contra Costa
Board of Supervisors acting in its capacity as the Board of Directors of the
Crockett-Carquinez Fire Protection District and the Contra Costa County Fire
Protection District adopted on November 18, 2025, adopting the 2025 California
Fire Code (Part 9) with changes, additions, and deletions, are adopted by
reference under the authority of Sections 50020-50022.9 of the California
Government Code.

The provisions of County Ordinance No. 2025-15, approved by the Contra Costa
Board of Supervisors acting in its capacity as the Board of Directors of the
Crockett-Carquinez Fire Protection District and the Contra Costa County Fire
Protection District adopted on December 9, 2025, adopting the 2025 California
Wildland-Urban Interface Code (Part 7) with changes, additions, and deletions,
are adopted by reference under the authority of Sections 50020-50022.9 of the
California Government Code.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 21 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765391
https://ecode360.com/47765249#47765392

Ordinance No. ___
Page 22 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765393#47765395
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765393#47765396
https://ecode360.com/47765395#47765395
https://ecode360.com/47765393#47765397
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765393#47765398
https://ecode360.com/47765393#47765399

Chapter 4 ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS

Sec. 9-4.01 Administration.
These regulations shall be known as the "Code for Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings," and may be so cited, and will be referred to herein as "this Chapter."

This Code is one of the technical codes of Building Regulations and is
administered under Title 9, Chapter 1 of the Hercules Municipal Code.

Sec. 9-4.02 Adoption by Reference.

The Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition,
published by the International Conference of Building Officials, is adopted by
reference and made a part of this Chapter as though fully set forth herein,
subject to the additions and deletions set forth in this Chapter.

Sec. 9-4.03 Copies on File.

One (1) copy and the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings Code as adopted by
Section 9-4.02, and all amendments thereto, are kept on file in the office of the
Building Official for inspection by the public.

Sec. 9-4.04 Amendments, Additions and Deletions.

Addition to Chapter 1, Section 102(b), Scope, to read as an additional paragraph
as follows:

Section 102(b). The Administrative part of this chapter is in addition to the City of
Hercules Building Regulations General Provisions, Title 9, Chapter 1, of the
Hercules Municipal Code. Where conflicts occur between this chapter and
Chapter 1, the provisions of Chapter 1, Title 9 of the Hercules Municipal Code
shall govern.

Sec. 9-4.05 Dangerous Building Defined.

Dangerous building shall be as defined in Section 302 of the 1997 Uniform Code
for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings as adopted in Section 9-3.02.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 23 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765393#47765400

Sec. 9-4.06 Repair, Vacation and Demolition.

See Section 403 of the 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings as adopted in Section 9-3.02.

Sec. 9-4.07 Enforcement of the Order of the Building Official.

(a) Issuance of Order. After any order of the Building Official or the Board of
Appeals made pursuant to this Code shall have become final, no person to
whom any such order is directed shall fail, neglect or refuse to obey any such
order. Any such person who fails to comply with any such order is guilty of an
infraction.

(b) Failure to Obey Order. If, after any order of the Building Official made
pursuant to this Code has become final, the person to whom such order is
directed shall fail, neglect or refuse to obey such order, the Building Official may
(i) cause such person to be prosecuted under subsection (a) of this Section or (ii)
institute any appropriate action to abate such building as a public nuisance.

(1) The Building Official shall cause the building described in such notice and
order to be vacated by posting at each entrance thereto a notice reading:

DANGEROUS BUILDING
DO NOT OCCUPY

It is an infraction to occupy this building, or to remove or deface this
notice.

Building Official
City of Hercules

(2) No person shall occupy any building which has been posted as specified in
this subsection. No person shall remove or deface any such notice so posted
until the repairs, demolition or removal ordered by the Building Official have been
completed and a Certificate of Occupancy issued pursuant to the provisions of
the Uniform Building Code and Chapter 9 of this Code.

(3) The Building Official may, in addition to any other remedy herein provided,
cause the building to be repaired to the extent necessary to correct the
conditions which render the building dangerous as set forth in the notice and
order; or, if the notice and ordered required demolition, to cause the building to
be sold and demolished and the materials, rubble and debris therefrom removed
and the lot cleaned. Any such repair or demolition work shall be accomplished
and the cost thereof paid and recovered in the manner hereinafter provided in
this Code. Any surplus realized from the sale of any such building, or from the
demolition thereof, over and above the cost of demolition and of cleaning the lot,
shall be paid over to the person or persons lawfully entitled thereto.

Chapter 4 MECHANICAL CODE

Ordinance No. ___
Page 24 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 25 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765401#47765403
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765401#47765404
https://ecode360.com/47765401#47765405
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765401#47765406
https://ecode360.com/47765401#47765407

Chapter 5 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

Sec. 9-5.01 Administration.

These regulations shall be known as the "International Property Maintenance
Code," and may be so cited, and will be referred to herein as "this Chapter." This
Code is one (1) of the technical codes of building regulations and is administered
under Title 9, Chapter 1 of the Hercules Municipal Code.

Sec. 9-5.02 Adoption by Reference.

The 2024 International Property Maintenance Code, including appendices, as
published by the International Code Council is adopted by reference and made a
part of this Chapter as though fully set forth herein, subject to the additions and
deletions as set forth in this Chapter.

Sec. 9-5.03 Copies on File.

One (1) copy of the 2024 Edition of the International Property Maintenance
Code, as adopted by Section 9-5.02, is on file in the office of the Chief Building
Official for inspection by the public.

Sec. 9-5.04 Amendments, Additions, and Deletions.
Amending Section 302.4, "Weeds," to read:

All premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds or
plant growth in excess of twelve (12) inches.

Amending Section 304.14, "Insect Screens," to read:

Ordinance No. ___
Page 26 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765401#47765408

Every door, window and other outside opening required for ventilation of
habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or any areas
where products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption are
processed, manufactured, packaged or stored shall be supplied with
approved tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh per inch (16 mesh
per 25 mm), and every screen door used for insect control shall have a self-
closing device in good working condition.

Exception: Screens shall not be required where other approved means, such
as air curtains or insect repellant fans, are employed.

Amending Section 602.3, "Heat Supply," to read:

Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one or
more dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to
furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall supply heat sufficient to maintain a
temperature of not less than 68° F in all habitable rooms, bathrooms, and
toilet rooms.

Amending Section 602.4, "Occupiable work spaces," to read:

Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat sufficient to
maintain a temperature of not less than 65° F during the period the spaces
are occupied.

Amending Section 604.2, "Service," to read:

The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve as a basis for
determining the need for additional facilities in accordance with the National
Electrical Code. Dwelling units shall be served by a three-wire, 120/240 volt,
single-phase electrical service having a rating of not less than 60 amperes.

Amending Section 702.1, "General," to read:

A safe and unobstructed path of travel shall be provided from any point in a
building or structure to the public way. Means of egress shall comply with the
California Fire Code.

Amending Section 702.2, "Aisles," to read:

The required width of aisles in accordance with the California Fire Code shall
be unobstructed.

Amending Section 702.3, "Locked Doors," to read:

All means of access doors shall be readily openable from the side from which
egress is to be made without the need for keys, special knowledge or effort,
except where the door hardware conforms to that permitted by the California
Building Code.

Amending Section 704.1, "General," to read:

Ordinance No. ___
Page 27 of 88



All systems, devices and equipment to detect a fire, actuate an alarm, or
suppress or control a fire or any combination thereof shall be maintained in
an operable condition at all times in accordance with the California Fire Code.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 28 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765411
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765412
https://ecode360.com/47765411#47765411
https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765413
https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765414
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765415
https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765416

Ordinance No. ___
Page 29 of 88


https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/65866
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/66998.1
https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765417
https://ecode360.com/47765409#ref47765413-1
https://ecode360.com/47765415#47765415

Ordinance No. ___
Page 30 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765418
https://ecode360.com/47765409#47765419
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765422
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765423
https://ecode360.com/47765422#47765422

Ordinance No. ___
Page 31 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765424
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765425
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765426
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765427
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765428
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765429
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765430
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765431

Ordinance No. ___
Page 32 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765426#47765426
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765432
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765433
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765434
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765435
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765435
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765437
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765437
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765439
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765439
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765441
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765441
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765443
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765443
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765445
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765445
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765447
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765447
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765449
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765449

Ordinance No. ___
Page 33 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765451
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765451
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765453
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765453
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765455
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765456
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765457
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765458

Ordinance No. ___
Page 34 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765459
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765460
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765461
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCP/1822.50
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765462
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765463

Ordinance No. ___
Page 35 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765464
https://ecode360.com/47765420#47765465
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765468
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765469
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765470

Ordinance No. ___
Page 36 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765469#47765469
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765471
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765472
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765473
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765474
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765475
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765476
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765477
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765478
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765479

Ordinance No. ___
Page 37 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765480
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765481
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCP/1822.50
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765482
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765483
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765484
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765485
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765486
https://ecode360.com/47765485#47765485
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765487

Ordinance No. ___
Page 38 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765488
https://ecode360.com/47765485#47765485
https://ecode360.com/47765487#47765487
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765489
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765490
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765491
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765492
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765493
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765494
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765495
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765496
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765497
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765498
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765499
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765500

Ordinance No. ___
Page 39 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765501
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765502
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765503
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765504
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765505
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765506
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765507
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765508
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765509
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765510
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765511

Ordinance No. ___
Page 40 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765512
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765513
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765514
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765515
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765516
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765517
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765518
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765519
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765520
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765521
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765522
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765523
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765524
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765525
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765526
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765527
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765528
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765529
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765530
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765531
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765532
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765533
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765534
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765535

Ordinance No. ___
Page 41 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765536
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765537
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765538
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765539
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765540
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765541
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765542
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765543
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765544
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765545
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765546
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765547
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765548

Page 42 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765549
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765550
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765551
https://ecode360.com/47765466#47765552
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765555
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765556
https://ecode360.com/47765555#47765555
https://ecode360.com/47765555#47765555
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765557
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263

Ordinance No. ___
Page 43 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765558
https://ecode360.com/47765555#47765555
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765559
https://ecode360.com/47765555#47765555
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765560
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765561
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765562
https://ecode360.com/47765561#47765561
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765563
https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765564

Ordinance No. ___
Page 44 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765553#47765565

Ordinance No. ___
Page 45 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 46 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 47 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47759327#47759327
https://ecode360.com/47759330#47759330
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765588#47765590

Ordinance No. ___
Page 48 of 88


https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765588#47765591
https://ecode360.com/47765590#47765590
https://ecode360.com/47765588#47765592
https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765593#47765595
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765593#47765596
https://ecode360.com/47765595#47765595
https://ecode360.com/47765593#47765597

Ordinance No. ___
Page 49 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765243#47765243
https://ecode360.com/47759263#47759263
https://ecode360.com/47765607#47765609
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765607#47765610
https://ecode360.com/47765609#47765609
https://ecode360.com/47765607#47765611

Ordinance No. ___
Page 50 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 51 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 52 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 53 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 54 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 55 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 56 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 57 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 58 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 59 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 60 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 61 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 62 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 63 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 64 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 65 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 66 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 67 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 68 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 69 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 70 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 71 of 88




Ordinance No. ___
Page 72 of 88




Ordinance No. ___
Page 73 of 88



7 % & g
/ \ \QO‘\\\,/ >
k— 90" > b~ R
\ f ~~-20'R
\\ / 32'R TYpP'
b il
! | TYP- i _20‘
20" 4 '-—-
950'DIAMETER so"Y*
CUL-DE-SAC

28R a
1YP* 1 |
! 46’

|
75' >
20
- =20
100' FAMMERHEAD ACCEPTABLE ALTERNATIVE
T0 100'HAMME RHEAD
FABLED1034
LENGTH- MINIMUM-— WIDTH
{eety {eety FURNAROUNDS REQURED
0-150 208 None required
151 -750 202 100-foot Hammerhead—50-foot—Y"75-foot-Shunt
i L . I

Over 750 Special-approvalreguired®

Ordinance No. ___
Page 74 of 88




Ordinance No. ___
Page 75 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 76 of 88



Ordinance No.
Page 77 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 78 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 79 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 80 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 81 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 82 of 88



{Ord-—545-5-16;2023)
Ordinance No. ___
Page 83 of 88



Ordinance No. ___
Page 84 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765638
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765639
https://municipal.codes/CA/CCR/
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765640
https://ecode360.com/47765639#47765639
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765641
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/50020
https://municipal.codes/CA/GOV/50022.9
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765642
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765643
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765644

Ordinance No. ___
Page 85 of 88


https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765645
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765646
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765647
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765648
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765649
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765650
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765651
https://ecode360.com/47765637#47765652

Ordinance No. ___
Page 86 of 88



SECTION 4. SEVERABILITY. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this
Ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid, such decisions shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would have adopted the
Ordinance, and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase thereof, irrespective of the
fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses or phrases be deleted.

SECTION 5. EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION. The City Clerk shall certify the
adoption of this Ordinance and shall publish or post the Ordinance as required by law. This
Ordinance shall be effective thirty (30) days from date of final adoption.

Ordinance No. ___
Page 87 of 88



THE FOREGOING ORDINANCE was first read at a regular meeting of the Hercules City
Council on the 13" day of January, 2026, and was passed and adopted at a regular meeting of the
Hercules City Council on the day of , 2026, by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

Chris Kelley, Mayor

Eibleis Melendez
City Clerk

Ordinance No. ___
Page 88 of 88



